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Rumble Boxing - Englewood
   
Discover Rumble Boxing: The Ultimate Fitness Experience in Englewood,
NJ

  Rumble Boxing in Englewood, New Jersey, offers a high-energy workout
environment that is perfect for anyone looking to elevate their fitness journey.
This boxing gym not only provides an impressive range of on-site services but
also builds a strong community among its members.  

Highlights of Rumble Boxing Englewood

  Rumble Boxing stands out with its unique class format, which combines boxing
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techniques with floor exercises. Members enjoy lively classes led by
enthusiastic instructors, including the highly praised Steph and Drew, who
motivate participants with engaging music playlists and dynamic workouts. With
a clean and appealing facility that features large lockers and immaculate
bathrooms, every visit feels refreshing.  

Accessibility and Accommodations

  Rumble Boxing is committed to inclusivity, boasting a wheelchair-accessible
car park and facilities that cater to everyone, regardless of fitness levels. The
gym's layout ensures that all members feel comfortable, allowing them to focus
on their fitness goals without distractions.   

Flexible Service Options

  At Rumble Boxing, appointment is required for classes to ensure a
personalized experience. The ability to schedule your workouts around your
personal routine makes it easier to stay on track. Additionally, Rumble offers 
active military discounts, making it more accessible for those who serve our
country.  

Planning Your Visit

  Before attending a class, it’s advisable to plan ahead. Bringing your own hand
wraps and gloves is encouraged, although glove rentals are available. Classes
are designed to be both intense and fun, focusing on building strength,
endurance, and community camaraderie.  

Why Rumble Boxing Stands Out

  Many members have shared positive experiences, noting the supportive
atmosphere created by both staff and fellow participants. From losing weight to
gaining confidence, individuals have seen remarkable transformations. "Rumble
is my home away from home," says one dedicated member, encapsulating the
sense of belonging that this gym fosters.  In summary, if you’re looking for a
motivating environment where you can achieve your fitness goals while enjoying
incredible workouts, Rumble Boxing in Englewood is undoubtedly worth
checking out!    
The business is situated at

  
 51 Nathaniel Pl, 07631  Englewood, New Jersey - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of said Boxing gym  is +1201-408-4439
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1201-408-4439
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https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=40.896019599999995%2C-73.9744399#map=15/40.896019599999995/-73.9744399
tel:+1201-408-4439
https://wa.me/+598+1201-408-4439


Our public attention hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 7:30?AM–12?PM   Tuesday 5:30?AM–8?PM   Wednesday 5:30?AM–8?PM   Thursday 5:30?AM–8?PM   Friday 5:30?AM–8?PM   Saturday 6?AM–6?PM   Sunday 7:30?AM–12?PM        The website is Rumble Boxing       If you require to change any information that you consider is not correct
about this page, we urge you to send a message and we will handle it as soon
as possible. In advance thank you very much. 
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Rumble boxing phone

Rumble boxing map
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Rumble boxing englewood

Rumble boxing by owner

5/11

https://www.electrofitness.com/img/rumble-boxing-englewood_310965.webp
https://www.electrofitness.com/img/rumble-boxing-by-owner_310965.webp


Rumble boxing boxing

Rumble boxing boxing gym
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