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CrossFit Coveted, Santa Clarita - Santa Clarita
   
Welcome to Coveted CrossFit Santa Clarita

  Coveted CrossFit, located in the heart of Santa Clarita, California, is not just
another gym; it's a community-centered fitness hub that celebrates diversity and
inclusion. The gym identifies as **Latino-owned**, **veteran-owned**, and
**women-owned**, offering a welcoming environment for everyone.  

Accessibility for All

  Coveted CrossFit boasts a **wheelchair-accessible entrance** and a
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**wheelchair-accessible car park**, ensuring everyone can participate in their
fitness journey. Their **gender-neutral toilets** further highlight their
commitment to inclusivity, making it a **transgender safe space** for all
members of the LGBTQ+ community.  

Amazing Amenities

  Members rave about the **amenities** at Coveted CrossFit. The facility
includes a **swimming pool**, showers, and even a massage room, creating a
comprehensive workout experience. Cleanliness is paramount here, with
well-maintained equipment and spaces that make every visit enjoyable. The
gym is also equipped with dedicated lifting rooms and enough equipment to
avoid sharing, making workouts smooth and efficient.  

Service Options to Fit Your Needs

  With flexible **service options**, Coveted CrossFit offers **online classes**
that cater to all schedules. Whether you're an early riser or prefer evening
sessions, there's a class for you. The coaches are highly knowledgeable and
invested in each athlete's fitness journey, providing individualized support and
encouragement to achieve personal goals.  

What Members Are Saying

  Feedback from members highlights the supportive community atmosphere.
“This gym family is the most supportive and encouraging gym community I have
ever found,” one member states. Another testimonial emphasizes, “From the
first day I walked in… I felt a sense of actual community.” Newcomers and
seasoned athletes alike appreciate how the gym fosters camaraderie among
members, making it a **great box** to call home.  

Join the Best Community in Santa Clarita

  Coveted CrossFit isn’t just about fitness; it's about building connections.
Members describe it as feeling like a family where encouragement and support
are abundant. With **friendly yet professional coaches**, you’ll find yourself
challenged to be your best while enjoying the process.  If you’re looking to start
your fitness journey or elevate your current routine, Coveted CrossFit in Santa
Clarita should be your top choice. Become part of a community that welcomes
everyone—no matter your fitness level—and discover what makes this gym truly
unique.    
We are positioned at

  
 26635 Valley Center Dr #102, 91351  Santa Clarita, California - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The phone number of the mentioned Gym  is +1661-219-7922
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1661-219-7922
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We look forward to seeing you at:

    Day Hours    Monday 8–11?AM   Tuesday Closed   Wednesday 5–11?AM 3:30–8:30?PM   Thursday 5–11?AM 3:30–8:30?PM   Friday 5–11?AM 3:30–8:30?PM   Saturday 5–11?AM 3:30–8:30?PM   Sunday 5–11?AM 3:30–6:30?PM        The website is CrossFit Coveted, Santa Clarita       In case you want to adjust any element that you consider is not precise
concerning this page, please forward a message and we will fix it as soon as
possible. Thanks beforehand thank you very much. 
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