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Mayweather Boxing + Fitness - Washington
   
Experience the Energy at Mayweather Boxing + Fitness in Washington,
D.C.

  Mayweather Boxing + Fitness is a vibrant fitness center located in the heart of
Washington, D.C. This gym stands out not only for its connection to the
legendary boxer Floyd Mayweather but also for the unique experiences it offers
to both boxing enthusiasts and fitness beginners.   

The Warm Welcome

  From the moment you walk into Mayweather, the welcoming atmosphere is
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palpable. Many visitors have commented on the professionalism and energy of
the staff. One individual noted, “From the moment I walked in, the energy and
professionalism of the staff made me feel welcomed and motivated.” Coach
Adrian is often mentioned for his phenomenal approach, as he helps students
improve their technique while simultaneously boosting their confidence.  

Top-Notch Coaching

  The gym boasts exceptional trainers who can cater to all skill levels. From
beginners to advanced boxers, everyone finds a coach who meets their needs.
Feedback from attendees highlights the expertise of coaches like Saiid and
Terrance, with one member stating, “Coach T (Terrance) is an excellent trainer”
who focuses on individual goals. The personalized attention provided by the
trainers is invaluable, ensuring that every session is both effective and
enjoyable.  

Mixed Experiences

  However, some reviews indicate inconsistencies in service, particularly
regarding class attendance. While many have had fantastic experiences, a few
disappointed customers reported instructors not showing up for scheduled
classes. Comments such as “the instructor never showed” and “this was
completely unprofessional” reveal that there is room for improvement in
maintaining reliability.   

A Community Atmosphere

  Despite some mixed reviews, the overwhelming sentiment is that Mayweather
Boxing + Fitness fosters a strong sense of community. Members frequently
mention how friendly and supportive both the staff and fellow gym-goers are. A
visitor expressed, “It’s more of a community than just a gym," making it a
popular choice for individuals looking to connect while pursuing their fitness
goals.  

Facility Highlights

  The facility itself is clean, well-organized, and equipped with a variety of
punching bags, weights, and cardio machines. Visitors have praised the space
for its layout and abundance of equipment, which allows everyone to get a good
workout without feeling crowded. Stephanie, a member of CHAARG, highlighted
the gym’s environment as “contagious”, which speaks to the motivating vibe
present within the walls.  

Final Thoughts

  Mayweather Boxing + Fitness in Washington, D.C., presents itself as a gym
that blends top-tier training with a community-oriented approach. While
experiences may vary, the dedication of the coaching staff, coupled with a
motivating atmosphere, generally leads to positive outcomes for members. If
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you’re in D.C. and looking for a place to improve your boxing skills or simply
stay fit, Mayweather Boxing + Fitness might just be the right fit for you!  
Whether a novice or seasoned athlete, this gym provides a dynamic
environment ready to challenge and inspire.     
Our establishment is located at

  
 1335 9th St NW, 20001  Washington, District of Columbia - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The phone number of the mentioned Gym  is +1202-777-2030
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1202-777-2030
 
    
 
   
    
 

Our business hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 8?AM–8?PM   Tuesday 6?AM–7:30?PM   Wednesday 8?AM–8?PM   Thursday 7?AM–7?PM   Friday 9?AM–3?PM   Saturday 9?AM–3?PM   Sunday 8?AM–7:30?PM        The website is Mayweather Boxing + Fitness       If you require to alter any detail that you consider is not precise concerning
this portal, please forward a message so we can we will fix it as soon as
possible. Thanks beforehand we appreciate it. 
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