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Beyond Barbell Gym - Weiser
   
Discover Beyond Barbell Gym in Weiser, Idaho

  Beyond Barbell Gym is not just a workout facility; it’s a vibrant community that
fosters physical and spiritual growth. Located in the charming town of Weiser,
Idaho, this gym stands out due to its unique offerings and welcoming
atmosphere.   

Amenities You'll Love

  At Beyond Barbell Gym, every visit feels like home. The facility boasts an
impressive array of **amenities**, including modern equipment and specialized
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machines you won't find elsewhere. With a **wheelchair-accessible entrance**
and ample parking, convenience is a top priority. Additionally, there’s a
**wheelchair-accessible car park** for ease of access.  Members also enjoy
complimentary **Wi-Fi** throughout the gym, making it easy to stay connected
or share your fitness journey on social media. For those looking to unwind
post-workout, the **sauna** provides a perfect relaxation spot.  

Service Options Tailored for Everyone

  Beyond Barbell caters to all fitness levels, offering both **online classes** for
those who prefer to work out from home and in-house personal training
sessions for a more personalized experience. **Membership is required** to
access the full range of services, but the value offered is unmatched. The
community spirit here ensures everyone feels welcome, regardless of their
fitness level.   With diverse **service options**, including group classes and
individual training programs, members can tailor their fitness journey to meet
their specific goals. The gym is equipped with a variety of machines, free
weights, and other fitness tools, ensuring comprehensive workouts for all.  

Family-Friendly Environment

  One standout feature at Beyond Barbell is the dedicated **kids area**. This
clean and entertaining space allows parents to focus on their workouts while
their children are engaged and safe. Whether you’re a single parent or a family
looking to stay active together, this aspect makes Beyond Barbell a top choice.  

Commitment to Cleanliness and Accessibility

  Cleanliness is a hallmark of Beyond Barbell Gym. Members consistently praise
the spotless conditions of both the gym equipment and facilities, including the
**toilet** areas. The staff takes great pride in maintaining a hygienic
environment, contributing to the overall pleasant experience at the gym.  The
gym's **accessibility** features ensure a welcoming atmosphere for everyone.
From the spacious layout to well-maintained facilities, each detail has been
thoughtfully planned to promote inclusivity and comfort.  

Join the Beyond Barbell Community

  If you’re searching for a gym in Weiser, Beyond Barbell is the ideal destination.
With its commitment to excellence in fitness, remarkable staff, and a supportive
community vibe, it's no wonder so many members describe it as their "second
home." Whether you want to achieve personal fitness goals or seek a place that
promotes spiritual growth, join Beyond Barbell and experience the
transformative power of a truly exceptional gym.   Don't miss out on the
opportunity to become part of a community that believes in the positive influence
of fitness and camaraderie. Visit Beyond Barbell Gym today and start your
journey toward better health and wellness!    
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We are based in

  
 1860 E 6th St, 83672  Weiser, Idaho - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The phone number of said Gym  is +1208-230-5101
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1208-230-5101
 
    
 
   
    
 

We open at the following schedule:

    Day Hours    Monday 10?AM–8?PM   Tuesday 10?AM–8?PM   Wednesday 10?AM–8?PM   Thursday 10?AM–8?PM   Friday 10?AM–2?PM   Saturday Closed   Sunday Closed        The website is Beyond Barbell Gym       In case you want to change any detail that you believe is incorrect related to
this portal, we ask send a message and we will adjust it as soon as possible.
Thank you in advance thanks. 

Images
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vitamin & supplements store
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wellness center
wellness program
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yoga studio
youth organization
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