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American Martial Arts Academy - Glasgow
   
Discover the American Martial Arts Academy in Glasgow, Kentucky

  Are you looking for a top-notch martial arts school that not only focuses on
self-defense but also promotes physical and mental well-being? Look no further
than the **American Martial Arts Academy** in Glasgow, Kentucky. This
establishment has garnered rave reviews from students and their families,
showcasing its commitment to excellence in martial arts education.  

Accessibility Features
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  The **American Martial Arts Academy** prides itself on being an inclusive
environment. With a **wheelchair-accessible car park** and a
**wheelchair-accessible entrance**, everyone can enjoy what this academy has
to offer. The facility ensures that accessibility is a top priority, making it easier
for all students to participate fully.  

Service Options Available

  At the American Martial Arts Academy, a range of **service options** cater to
different needs. From beginner classes to advanced training, the instructors are
dedicated professionals who focus on building confidence in their students. One
reviewer mentioned, “My confidence has improved, my physical and mental
well-being has improved.” This speaks volumes about the positive impact of the
training provided.  

On-Site Services

  The academy offers various **on-site services** designed to enhance the
learning experience. Friendly yet professional instructors, like Mr. Walker and
Mr. England, create a welcoming atmosphere where asking questions is
encouraged. Parents highly recommend this school for children, stating, "They
have taught my children so much over the years."   

Fun Beyond Training

  In addition to martial arts classes, the American Martial Arts Academy is also a
fantastic venue for special events. One parent shared, “Highly recommend this
place for birthday parties! My son has had his birthday party here the last 3
years.” With engaging activities and even the thrill of cutting a cake with a real
sword, kids of all ages are sure to have a memorable experience.  

Conclusion

  If you’re in Glasgow, Kentucky, the **American Martial Arts Academy** is the
perfect choice for anyone interested in martial arts. With its focus on
accessibility, professional instructors, and enjoyable experiences, it's a place
where both kids and adults can thrive. Don't miss out on the opportunity to
improve your skills and join a supportive community!    
You can reach us at

  
 402 Reynolds Rd, 42141  Glasgow, Kentucky - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The contact line of said Martial arts school  is +1270-651-3446
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1270-651-3446
 
    
 
   
    
 

2/8

https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=37.0121975%2C-85.9334313#map=15/37.0121975/-85.9334313
tel:+1270-651-3446
https://wa.me/+598+1270-651-3446


Our opening hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 11?AM–7?PM   Tuesday 11?AM–7?PM   Wednesday 11?AM–7?PM   Thursday 11?AM–7?PM   Friday Closed   Saturday Closed   Sunday 11?AM–7?PM        The website is American Martial Arts Academy       In case you want to modify any information that you feel is incorrect
concerning this site, we urge you to forward a message so we can we will fix it
quickly. Thank you in advance thanks. 
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