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Tiger Do Jang Karate & Fitness - Waldorf
   
Welcome to Tiger DO Jang Karate & Fitness in Waldorf, Maryland

  At **Tiger DO Jang Karate & Fitness**, we are proud to be the only Tang Soo
Do school in Waldorf. Under the expert guidance of Grandmaster Jenkins, an
8th Dan black belt and a well-known figure who has even appeared on MTV, our
school offers unparalleled martial arts training for all ages.  

Accessibility Matters

  We understand that accessibility is crucial for everyone in the community. Our
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**wheelchair-accessible car park** ensures that all students and visitors can
easily access our dojang. Additionally, we have a **wheelchair-accessible
entrance** to make your visit as seamless as possible.  

A Community-Focused Environment

  The owner and staff at Tiger DO Jang give 100% to their students and the
community. This commitment is reflected in our popular before and after school
and summer programs, which are huge hits with kids and parents alike.
Comments from satisfied parents highlight the dedication of our staff,
particularly Ms. Janice, who has created a friendly and accommodating
atmosphere for every child.  

World-Class Training Experience

  Our school is not just about learning martial arts; it's about personal
development and fitness. Many parents rave about their children's experiences,
noting how Master Jenkins and our team of black belt instructors pour their
hearts into teaching valuable life lessons alongside martial arts skills. Our
environment promotes leadership, courage, patience, and discipline, making it a
motivational space for both children and adults.  

Why Choose Tiger DO Jang?

  Choosing Tiger DO Jang means choosing a world-class training environment
led by an enthusiastic master trainer. Parents have expressed gratitude for the
transformations they've seen in their children, citing the positive and
motivational culture fostered within our dojang. From self-improvement to
building confidence, each student leaves with invaluable life skills.  

Join Us Today!

  Whether you're a beginner or looking to refine your skills, Tiger DO Jang
Karate & Fitness welcomes you. Come experience our exceptional training,
community focus, and accessible facilities. We invite you to join us and discover
how martial arts can change your life, just as it has for many of our students.    
We are situated in

  
 1 Henry Ford Cir, 20602  Waldorf, Maryland - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of said Martial arts school  is +1301-645-1529
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1301-645-1529
 
    
 
   
    
 

Our public attention hours are:
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https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=38.6159914%2C-76.8991278#map=15/38.6159914/-76.8991278
tel:+1301-645-1529
https://wa.me/+598+1301-645-1529


   Day Hours    Monday Closed   Tuesday 6?AM–6:30?PM   Wednesday 6?AM–6:30?PM   Thursday 6?AM–6:30?PM   Friday 6?AM–6:30?PM   Saturday 6?AM–6:30?PM   Sunday 10?AM–3?PM        The website is Tiger DO Jang Karate & Fitness       If you require to adjust any information that you think is not precise
concerning this page, we ask send a message and we will fix it as soon as
possible. With anticipation thanks. 
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Tiger do jang karate fitness street view 360deg

Tiger do jang karate fitness map
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